T Ho o TA0-33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazetie of India

EXTRAORDINARY
90T III—9vs 4
PART III—Section 4

TR & WehrioTe
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

|, 377] =3 faoell, HTeaR, STEER 9, 2018/3T¥a 17, 1940
No. 377] NEW DELHI, TUESDAY, OCTOBER 9, 2018/ASVINA 17, 1940

T T TIAeTET AT
FfgET
E faeett, 9 warqae, 2018
TG FT TIAETET ST (HFISI & G99 § FIER » 9q9g} § g toq giar) deava [fFaw, 2018

w86, dftsrsASiamaa.RfR./2018. —a w1 afaeagl s, afaergt sifafa=m, 2002
(2003 FT 12) T &7 64 FTIT T&T TRAT FT TART FA gU, AT HT TAeTel AANT (FATST % dae |

FATL F G o qatard HAr) Bfaam, 2011 F7 T gemes #a & forg Fwferfeg B s« g,
FATq -

1. gfera A 3T Te—

(1) = fafF=at =1 w@ferg A 9 #1 Sfoerd? SRt (S99 F S99 § FA F go9ge F gatad
i) emres fafaee, 2018 2

(2) T TSI § 3% THTIF it AT AT TG BT |
2. T T TAETLT AT (AT 6 Hael H FTLATL o GeAagT T qaterd Tienar) &=, 2011 §,--

(1) fafa=w 2 &% satafaa (3) &, "wuet stferfa=m, 1956 (1956 T 1)" <rsal, 3iwhi ¥ FIGHI 6 TTH 9T
eI @ ST, 79iq -

"ot st 2013 (2013 #7118)" ;
(2) AT 5 4,

(F) SUEEIH (4) F TqF |, "SqGTS F" A&@0 F TAT WHAEgd S Erha & ST,
FAT 1~

" et i 4meT 6 it ITYTT (2%F)" ;

(@) Iufafa=e (6) * wiqs #, "wafd w1 ersai & warq Faferfua siaenfg B s,
qAT -

" erterfe i g 6 i ITUTRT (2F)" ;
5931 GI/2018 (1)




THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART HI—SEC. 4]

@) Sufatay (7) %,--
(i) @ (M) ¥, "HAAT Arerf=aq, 1956 % T Toregha” eTeal A< el T AT FhAT SO ;

(i) &= (7) |, "7 FO AfSf=w, 1956 (1956 T 1) FT g7 617 § TRCATRT T8 q0FET
FIA" 9Teal, STRT AT FIIHT FT AT T IO

(3) faffaw 9 & sufafaem (2) F wiqs &, "srafer " ersat & wanq Mt saenfia B s,
AT -

" srferfaae it 9T 6 F ITETT (2F)," ;
(4) T 14 9 --
(F) ITEEAT (2F) H,--
(i) "aTa fea" ereat % ware v et orsa T ST, ooy -
"o e e
(ii) THY TEGF |, "AATH H" TR TAT (AT S AT AT STua, d7iq -
" erferfee it g 6 it ITETT (2)," ;

(@) It (5) F TqF |, "HATT F" el F TAT HHEd qEArud AT S,
JIAT (-

N

", TSI T 9T 6 Y ITERT (27F)," ;
(5) fafamm 16 & sufafa=m &, "ara fam" esat & v o Fsforfera erss @@ SO, aaiq -
"qTd w1 faaE
(6) faf=\ 16 & TeaTq Meterea EfHaw siaetea T ST, s -
"16%. TIAAT FY YT AT 3 S8 T BT HAT—
(1) srfarfaam it g 29 FF ITgT (1) F et AT ST R S & a@ Gl off T,
TINT HATS % TeIaTe & e 9¢ 34 fafaawt & A 5 a1 fafagw 8 & srefim <F
TE FAAT T ATIE A ST IH [ BIEA F Al SITAT & T |
(2) sufafa=e (1) F srefiq geaT 3o fore S 6 gom #, U gEET F g9y § g5 ¥ e
6 F, FATST F TAHE G &F T8 95 AT % Hqae § g7 Hr & I aHrEiegG

oo STTomT, 9 @y 3 9 g A @Il gEar o o i arig F 9 9 F ofia
T smarg 1" ;
(7) fafaw 19 % safafaem (2) F v w Raferfea safetaas e s, st -
"(2) SIART gRT afataaw 7 amer 29 i ITERT (1) F qfi FE O 990 A F 0F, A F
TETRTE FATTT ® IUTALOT KT TEATT FT Tobdl 31T SH AT IT AART rfafaay i amr 31 6
ITLTT (1) F Srele SeEarierg SIS 7 STqHIET FT TH
Ui @t HATSA o TR G SUTAL T Y19 hAT STaT &, Tl Uag (o & A8 & Afdih
THT F, ST YA UL & AT & (o0 sraegs g, =9 e & sufaffas (1), sdfaftes
#X &TT 6 T ITLTRT (25) A srfafagw &t gmer 31 it 3ugmer (1) | Suafaa safer & sraatsa
ERIE IR
(8) fafaam 25 & sufafa=m (1) & wanq Faferfaa sutafas et G srom, st -
"(1%) |ATST % TR, ATAAH 0 g7 29 HT ITTT (1) F TfT AT AAT & AL % 919,
I AT § AATEE Tomgear Harst F7 q9TeTE F & 0 STrar w7 STEard w7 qehl oY 39
SMETT U AT srtarfaare it emer 31 it ST (1) F refi swearterd 9arse F7 AT FT T




[«rT [I-Eve 4] RA h1 ASIA : STHIYROI 3

T UH R AT H, TEATEd SUTA & HEATHA 6 (o0 T Uag & | Saige® At a9
I, At ¥ 9T 6 Y ST (2F), AfAtAaw £ g 29 Fir ITUTT (2) A7 sty Y e
31 &Y 39T (11) ¥ Suafad srafer & sraatsra frar s 1" ;

(9) fafe=m 27 & AR (1) F Tanq FHfed SUE s siq:earaa AT STos, s -

"(1) ST ERT it 7 T g T yeartEa garee ® suiaeon & fhareas % oo adaer sraeae g
qr g UH Faedr o7 odt #, ST AAN FRT AauTg Ty S, 7T W@ g U Ghareaae wv
TTAATRT LA & [T AR T [H R FT T 1"

fRwar =, at==
[FersTTo=-111/4/374T./301/18]

feequr ; g fofaw, W % TS, g, 9 L E 4, a1 |9, 2011 F AtegEar 9. v, 1-
1 [EST /A TREH/2011-1 2/ /H s 5T TR 6T 70 9 S oA 39w et g
Tetrere fohT a1 o --

(F) TG F TSI, FETITOT, 907 11, G 4, @ 23 wea<r, 2012 F1 wLA. 3-1/790/
w1 201 2/ /A =E g o wrea wr afeewalt ST (S F ey H
FILATE & HAAgE & Faterd Tiehar) derres fafaaw, 2012 ;

(@) 9 F I, HTYTO, AW 1, § 4, 9199 4 19, 2013 &7 wr.E. 3-1/790/
w7 201 2/ /AR =E g o wrea i afaerat ST (S F ey H
FILATE & HAAGTE & Faterd Tiehar) derree fafaaw, 2013 ;

(M) AT F TOUA, FAATITO, 9 11, TS 4, 9 28 A1+, 2014 &7 F1H, HHreme/
HET/Ear.A./2014 =T TR AT T TAeTe T AaRT (A F 999 § FLar &
TEg & gefard wikar) werras fafaaw, 2014 ;

(F) ARG F OIS, AT, 90 11, 8 4, I 1 Ja1s, 2015 F FLE. HEems/
HEr/EAr.A./2015 R TR AT T TAeTe T ATRT (A F 994 § FILare &
TAAEE & "atard wiwmar) wenes f&fHem, 2015 ; @

(F) AT F T9UA, FETYTO, 9T 3, G 4, qE 7 qad, 2016 F ELH. HHTE/
HET/EAr.AT./2016 TR TRITT AT T TAeTe T ATRT (A F 994 § FLar &
HoAagY & gafaa gimar) deree fafas, 2016 |

THE COMPETITION COMMISSION OF INDIA
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 9th October, 2018

The Competition Commission of India (Procedure in regard to the transaction of business relating to
combinations) Amendment Regulations, 2018

F. No. CCI/CD/Amend/Comb.Regl./2018.—In exercise of the powers conferred by section 64 of the
Competition Act, 2002 (12 of 2003), the Competition Commission of India hereby makes the following
regulations further to amend the Competition Commission of India (Procedure in regard to the transaction of
business relating to combinations) Regulations, 2011, namely:—

1. Short title and commencement.—

(1) These regulations may be called the Competition Commission of India (Procedure in regard to the
transaction of business relating to combinations) Amendment Regulations, 2018.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.



4

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART HI—SEC. 4]

2.

In the Competition Commission of India (Procedure in regard to the transaction of business relating to
combinations) Regulations, 2011,—

(1)in regulation 2, in sub-regulation (3), for the words, figures and brackets “ Companies Act, 1956 (1 of
1956)”, the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“Companies Act, 2013 (18 of 2013)”;
(2)in regulation 5,-

(a) in proviso to sub-regulation (4), after the words “period provided in”, the following shall
be inserted, namely:-

“sub-section (2A) of section 6 of the Act,”;

(b) in proviso to sub-regulation (6), after the words “period provided in”, the following shall
be inserted, namely:-

“sub-section (2A) of section 6 of the Act,”;
(©) in sub-regulation (7),

(i) in clause (c), the words and figures “registered under the Companies Act, 1956 shall
be omitted;

(i1) in clause (d), the words, brackets and figures “or a Government company as defined
in section 617 of the Companies Act, 1956 (1 of 1956)” shall be omitted;

3) in regulation 9, in proviso to sub-regulation (2), after the words “period provided in”, the
following shall be inserted, namely:-

“sub-section (2A) of section 6 of the Act,”;
“4) in regulation 14,-
(a) in sub-regulation (2A),-
1) for the words “seven days”, the following words shall be substituted, namely:-
“seven working days”;

(i)  in the second proviso, after the words “period specified in”, the following shall be
inserted, namely:-
“sub-section (2A) of section 6 of the Act,”;

(b) in the proviso to sub-regulation (5), after the words “period provided in”, the following
shall be inserted, namely:-

“sub-section (2A) of section 6 of the Act,”;
o) in regulation 16, in sub-regulation (5), for the word “seven days”, the following words shall be
substituted, namely:-
“seven working days”;
6) after regulation 16, the following regulation shall be inserted, namely:-
“16A. Withdrawal and refiling of notice.-

(1) At any time prior to the issuance of notice under sub-section (1) of section 29 of the Act,
the Commission may on the request of the parties to the combination allow withdrawal
and refiling of the notice given under regulation 5 or regulation 8 of these regulations.

(2) In case of withdrawal of notice under sub-regulation (1), the fee already paid in respect
of such notice shall be adjusted against the fee payable in respect of new notice given by
the parties to the combination provided the new notice is given within three months from
the date of withdrawal.”;

@) in regulation 19, for sub-regulation (2), the following sub-regulation shall be substituted, namely:-

“2) Before the Commission forming an opinion under sub-section (1) of section 29 of the
Act, the parties to the combination may offer modification to the combination and on that
basis, the Commission may approve the proposed combination under sub-section (1) of
section 31 of the Act:



[9FT [I-ETE 4] qRA T TSI ¢ AR 5

®)

()]

Provided that where modification is offered by the parties to the combination, the
additional time, not exceeding fifteen days, needed for evaluation of the offered
modification, shall be excluded from the period provided in sub-regulation (1) of this
regulation, sub-section (2A) of section 6 of the Act and sub-section (11) of section 31 of
the Act.”;

in regulation 25, after sub-regulation (1), the following sub-regulation shall be inserted, namely:-

“(1A) Along with their response to the notice issued under sub-section (1) of section 29 of the
Act, the parties to the combination may offer modification to address the prima facie
concerns in the said notice and on that basis, the Commission may approve the proposed
combination under sub-section (1) of section 31 of the Act:

Provided that in such a case, the additional time, not exceeding fifteen days, needed for
evaluation of the modification offered, shall be excluded from the period provided in
sub-section (2A) of section 6 of the Act, sub-section (2) of section 29 of the Act and sub-
section (11) of section 31 of the Act.”;

in regulation 27, for sub-regulation (1), the following sub-regulation shall be substituted, namely:-

“(1)  Where the Commission is of the opinion that the implementation of the modifications to
the proposed combination needs supervision, it may appoint agencies to oversee such
implementation, on such terms and conditions as may be determined by the
Commission.”.

SMITA JHINGRAN, Secy.
[ADVT.-111/4/Exty./301/18]

Note: Principal Regulations were published vide Notification No. F. No. 1-1/ Combination Regulations/2011-
12/CD/CCI in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part III, Section 4, dated the 11th May, 2011 and
were subsequently amended by,—

(a)

(b)

(c)

(d)

(e)

The Competition Commission of India (Procedure in regard to the transaction of business
relating to combinations) Amendment Regulations, 2012, published vide F. No. 3-1/Amend/
Comb.Regl./2012/CD/CCI in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part III, Section 4, dated the
23" February, 2012;

The Competition Commission of India (Procedure in regard to the transaction of business
relating to combinations) Amendment Regulations, 2013, published vide F. No. 3-1/Amend/
Comb.Regl./2012/CD/CCI in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part III, Section 4, dated the
4™ April, 2013;

The Competition Commission of India (Procedure in regard to the transaction of business
relating to combinations) Amendment Regulations, 2014, published vide F. No. CCI/CD/
Amend/Comb.Regl./2014 in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part III, Section 4, dated the
28" March, 2014;

The Competition Commission of India (Procedure in regard to the transaction of business
relating to combinations) Amendment Regulations, 2015, published vide F. No. CCI/CD/
Amend/Comb.Regl./2015 in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part III, Section 4, dated the
01* July, 2015; and

The Competition Commission of India (Procedure in regard to the transaction of business
relating to combinations) Amendment Regulations, 2016, published vide F. No. CCI/CD/
Amend/Comb.Regl./2016 in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part III, Section 4, dated the
07™ January, 2016.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.

SARVESH ooty
KUMAR SRIVASTAVA

Date: 2018.10.09

SRIVASTAVA  2303:06 +0530°



		2018-10-09T23:03:06+0530
	SARVESH KUMAR SRIVASTAVA




